
R E T A I L  S A V I N G S

Pharmacy
Your Meds | Your Savings

W a l m a r t  $ 4 R x
P r o g r a m
Discounted pricing on select
generic medications*

G o o d  R x

T A L K  W I T H  Y O U R  P R O V I D E R  T O D A Y !

W e l l R x

Price comparisons and  
coupons available at over
70,000 retail pharmacies*

Price comparisons and
coupons available at over
65,000 retail pharmacies*

*Option may not be billed
through insurance and do not
apply to deductibles and/or
out of pocket maximums  



Cost Plus Drugs

Amazon Rx Pass
$5 monthly membership fee
with access to select generic
medications free of charge +
free shipping*

Discounted pricing on over
350 generic medications*

DiRx
Discounted pricing on
generic medications with
prices as low as $3 per
prescription + free shipping*

E x p r e s s  S c r i p t s

M A I L  O R D E R

Receive a 33% discount on 90
day supply of your medications

O N L I N E  F U L F I L L M E N T
S E R V I C E S

*Option may not be billed
through insurance and do not
apply to deductibles and/or
out of pocket maximums  


